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Political parties are central to democratic life, yet there is no standard definition to describe them or the role
they occupy. "Voter-centered" theoretical approaches suggest that parties are the mere recipients of voter
interests and loyalties. "Party-centered" approaches, by contrast, envision parties that polarize, democratize,
or dominate society. In addition to offering isolated and competing notions of democratic politics, such
approaches are also silent on the role of the state and are unable to account for organizations like Hamas,
Hezbollah, and the African National Congress, which exhibit characteristics of parties, states, and social
movements simultaneously.

In this timely book, Cedric de Leon examines the ways in which social scientists and other observers have
imagined the relationship between parties and society. He introduces and critiques the full range of
approaches, using enlivening comparative examples from across the globe. Cutting through a vast body of
research, de Leon offers a succinct and lively analysis that outlines the key thinking in the field, placing it in
historical and contemporary context. The resulting book will appeal to students of sociology, political
science, social psychology, and related fields.
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From reader reviews:

Donna Jost:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Yeah, you can
choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to take a walk,
shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open as well as read a book eligible Party and Society?
Maybe it is being best activity for you. You already know beside you can spend your time along with your
favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree with it has the opinion or you have additional
opinion?

Clarence Hamm:

The actual book Party and Society will bring you to definitely the new experience of reading the book. The
author style to explain the idea is very unique. Should you try to find new book to learn, this book very
suited to you. The book Party and Society is much recommended to you you just read. You can also get the
e-book from the official web site, so you can quickly to read the book.

Lewis Skinner:

Precisely why? Because this Party and Society is an unordinary book that the inside of the guide waiting for
you to snap that but latter it will jolt you with the secret that inside. Reading this book beside it was fantastic
author who all write the book in such incredible way makes the content inside of easier to understand,
entertaining means but still convey the meaning thoroughly. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating
having this anymore or you going to regret it. This amazing book will give you a lot of rewards than the
other book possess such as help improving your skill and your critical thinking technique. So , still want to
hold off having that book? If I ended up you I will go to the reserve store hurriedly.

Sandra Brown:

Do you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Make an
effort to pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't ascertain book by its include may
doesn't work the following is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not while fantastic as
in the outside appear likes. Maybe you answer may be Party and Society why because the amazing cover that
make you consider with regards to the content will not disappoint anyone. The inside or content will be
fantastic as the outside or maybe cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly assist you to pick up this book.
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