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Em Hansen, the popular heroine at the center of Sarah Andrews's unique geology mystery series, has landed
a new job, although an unusual one: a client affiliated with a museum wants Em to investigate a painting by
the famed western painter Frederick Remington. The client believes it's a fake, but Em must explore the
painting's provenance to find out. The project takes her through Wyoming, Utah, Washington DC and
Pennsylvania, and halfway through the trip Em finds she's also chasing a murderer: someone seems to be
slowly poisoning her client's family. Before long, her innocent research project has taken a sinister twist, and
it's up to Em to find out what's going on in time to save her own skin. All in all, Earth Colors is another
smart, inventive mystery from Sarah Andrews, a fan favorite.
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From reader reviews:

Norman Eiland:

Book is actually written, printed, or created for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a
reserve. Book has a different type. As we know that book is important factor to bring us around the world.
Next to that you can your reading ability was fluently. A reserve Earth Colors (Em Hansen Mysteries) will
make you to become smarter. You can feel considerably more confidence if you can know about every little
thing. But some of you think which open or reading some sort of book make you bored. It is not necessarily
make you fun. Why they might be thought like that? Have you seeking best book or acceptable book with
you?

Ann Lemieux:

This book untitled Earth Colors (Em Hansen Mysteries) to be one of several books in which best seller in
this year, honestly, that is because when you read this book you can get a lot of benefit onto it. You will
easily to buy this kind of book in the book store or you can order it via online. The publisher on this book
sells the e-book too. It makes you more readily to read this book, as you can read this book in your Cell
phone. So there is no reason to you to past this reserve from your list.

Juana Rummel:

The particular book Earth Colors (Em Hansen Mysteries) will bring one to the new experience of reading a
book. The author style to describe the idea is very unique. In the event you try to find new book you just
read, this book very suited to you. The book Earth Colors (Em Hansen Mysteries) is much recommended to
you to read. You can also get the e-book in the official web site, so you can quicker to read the book.

Gerard Norman:

On this era which is the greater individual or who has ability to do something more are more valuable than
other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you must do
is just spending your time not much but quite enough to get a look at some books. On the list of books in the
top listing in your reading list is usually Earth Colors (Em Hansen Mysteries). This book which can be
qualified as The Hungry Hills can get you closer in getting precious person. By looking up and review this
reserve you can get many advantages.
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