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The Key of Solomon, save for a cultailed and incomplete copy published in France in the seventeeth century,
has never yet been printed, but has for centuries remained in Manuscript form inaccessible to all but the few
fortunate scholars to whom the innermost recesses of the great libraries were open. The fountain-head and
storehouse of Qabalistic Magic, and the origin of much of the ceremonial magic of Midieval times, the
"Key" has been valued by Occult writers as a work of the highest authority.

I see no reason to doubt the tradition which assigns the authorship of the "Key" to King Solomon, for among
others Josephus, the Jewish historian, especially mentions the magical works attributed to that monarch; this
is comfirmed by many Eastern traditions, and his magical skill is frequently mentioned by the Old Adepts.
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From reader reviews:

Ann Gross:

The publication with title The Greater Key of Solomon has a lot of information that you can learn it. You can
get a lot of benefit after read this book. This specific book exist new know-how the information that exist in
this reserve represented the condition of the world now. That is important to yo7u to learn how the
improvement of the world. This book will bring you throughout new era of the globalization. You can read
the e-book in your smart phone, so you can read it anywhere you want.

Alejandra Dunlap:

The reason? Because this The Greater Key of Solomon is an unordinary book that the inside of the reserve
waiting for you to snap it but latter it will distress you with the secret it inside. Reading this book alongside it
was fantastic author who write the book in such wonderful way makes the content within easier to
understand, entertaining technique but still convey the meaning entirely. So , it is good for you for not
hesitating having this nowadays or you going to regret it. This book will give you a lot of positive aspects
than the other book include such as help improving your proficiency and your critical thinking technique. So
, still want to hold up having that book? If I ended up you I will go to the reserve store hurriedly.

Leslie Babcock:

Do you have something that you want such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to select book like
comic, brief story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not hoping The Greater Key of Solomon that
give your enjoyment preference will be satisfied through reading this book. Reading habit all over the world
can be said as the way for people to know world much better then how they react in the direction of the
world. It can't be explained constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky individual but for all of you
who wants to end up being success person. So , for every you who want to start reading through as your good
habit, it is possible to pick The Greater Key of Solomon become your starter.

Sean Ward:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got college students? We believe that that
problem was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. And
you also know that little person similar to reading or as reading become their hobby. You need to know that
reading is very important as well as book as to be the point. Book is important thing to add you knowledge,
except your personal teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update concerning something by book.
Amount types of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is this The Greater Key of
Solomon.
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