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This is an excellent reference and guide to intervention for academics, clinicians, and educations concerned
with understanding and decreasing violence."--Choice: Current Reviews for Academic Libraries

In the U.S., youth violence is the second leading cause of death for young people between the ages of 10 and
24. This volume, authored by a noted psychotherapist with more than 30 years of experience in family
violence, examines recent violent episodes perpetrated by young offenders in order to understand their root
causes and to disseminate current prevention and treatment methods through a multidisciplinary lens.

The book addresses the theoretical underpinnings of youth violence from the perspectives of psychology and
neurobiology, describes different types of violence, includes the latest research on "what works" in
prevention and treatment, and examines connections between substance abuse, familial and community
violence, and school failure in promoting violence in adolescents. Youth Violence is a comprehensive yet
highly readable volume for mental health and social service professionals who work with youth and families,
and violence researchers.

Key Features:

Provides real life case studies from Virginia Tech, Columbine, and other recent violent incidents●

perpetrated by young people
Written by an author with over 30 years of experience in youth violence and creator of the premier risk●

assessment test in use today
Offers the latest findings on "what works" in prevention and treatment●
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From reader reviews:

Sheila Gallagher:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing for us
to find out everything in the world. Each reserve has different aim or even goal; it means that reserve has
different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their time to read a book. They may be reading
whatever they get because their hobby is reading a book. Consider the person who don't like examining a
book? Sometime, person feel need book if they found difficult problem or even exercise. Well, probably you
should have this Youth Violence: Theory, Prevention, and Intervention.

Thomas Jones:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone in
everywhere. The information can be a expertise or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider if those information which is in the former life are challenging be find than now's taking seriously
which one is appropriate to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you receive the
unstable resource then you have it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All
those possibilities will not happen inside you if you take Youth Violence: Theory, Prevention, and
Intervention as your daily resource information.

Robert Hawkins:

A lot of people always spent their particular free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them
household or their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, or even
playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity here is look different you can read a
new book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can spent all day
every day to reading a reserve. The book Youth Violence: Theory, Prevention, and Intervention it is very
good to read. There are a lot of people that recommended this book. These folks were enjoying reading this
book. Should you did not have enough space to create this book you can buy typically the e-book. You can
m0ore effortlessly to read this book from the smart phone. The price is not to fund but this book possesses
high quality.

James Hutchinson:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book as
compared to can satisfy your small amount of time to read it because this all time you only find publication
that need more time to be read. Youth Violence: Theory, Prevention, and Intervention can be your answer
since it can be read by you who have those short extra time problems.
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