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To Save the Children of Korea is the first book about the origins and history of international adoption.
Although it has become a commonplace practice in the United States, we know very little about how or why
it began, or how or why it developed into the practice that we see today.

Arissa Oh argues that international adoption began in the aftermath of the Korean War. First established as
an emergency measure through which to evacuate mixed-race "GI babies," it became a mechanism through
which the Korean government exported its unwanted children: the poor, the disabled, or those lacking
Korean fathers. Focusing on the legal, social, and political systems at work, this book shows how the growth
of Korean adoption from the 1950s to the 1980s occurred within the context of the neocolonial U.S.-Korea
relationship, and was facilitated by crucial congruencies in American and Korean racial thought, government
policies, and nationalisms. It also argues that the international adoption industry played an important but
unappreciated part in the so-called Korean "economic miracle."

Korean adoption served as a kind of template as international adoption began, in the late 1960s, to expand to
new sending and receiving countries. Ultimately, Oh demonstrates that although Korea was not the first
place that Americans adopted from internationally, it was the place where organized, systematic international
adoption was born.
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From reader reviews:

Linda Amos:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be revise about what going on or facts even knowledge
to make these individuals keep up with the era which can be always change and progress. Some of you
maybe may update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems coming
to anyone is you don't know what one you should start with. This To Save the Children of Korea: The Cold
War Origins of International Adoption (Asian America) is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with
the world. Why, because this book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Shawn Marsh:

This To Save the Children of Korea: The Cold War Origins of International Adoption (Asian America) is
great reserve for you because the content and that is full of information for you who also always deal with
world and get to make decision every minute. That book reveal it data accurately using great arrange word or
we can state no rambling sentences in it. So if you are read that hurriedly you can have whole details in it.
Doesn't mean it only gives you straight forward sentences but tough core information with lovely delivering
sentences. Having To Save the Children of Korea: The Cold War Origins of International Adoption (Asian
America) in your hand like keeping the world in your arm, information in it is not ridiculous 1. We can say
that no reserve that offer you world inside ten or fifteen small right but this e-book already do that. So , it is
good reading book. Hi Mr. and Mrs. busy do you still doubt this?

Leona Ferretti:

With this era which is the greater man or who has ability to do something more are more precious than other.
Do you want to become among it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you are related is just
spending your time not much but quite enough to experience a look at some books. On the list of books in
the top collection in your reading list is definitely To Save the Children of Korea: The Cold War Origins of
International Adoption (Asian America). This book and that is qualified as The Hungry Hills can get you
closer in turning out to be precious person. By looking upwards and review this e-book you can get many
advantages.

Eric Butler:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got students? We believe that that query
was given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, All people has different hobby. And you also
know that little person such as reading or as examining become their hobby. You have to know that reading
is very important along with book as to be the point. Book is important thing to provide you knowledge,
except your current teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update regarding something by book.
Different categories of books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them are these claims To
Save the Children of Korea: The Cold War Origins of International Adoption (Asian America).
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