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In September 1781, the captain of the British slave ship Zong ordered 133 slaves thrown overboard, enabling
the ship’s owners to file an insurance claim for their lost “cargo.” Accounts of this horrific event quickly
became a staple of abolitionist discourse on both sides of the Atlantic. Ian Baucom revisits, in unprecedented
detail, the Zong atrocity, the ensuing court cases, reactions to the event and trials, and the business and social
dealings of the Liverpool merchants who owned the ship. Drawing on the work of an astonishing array of
literary and social theorists, including Walter Benjamin, Giovanni Arrighi, Jacques Derrida, and many
others, he argues that the tragedy is central not only to the trans-Atlantic slave trade and the political and
cultural archives of the black Atlantic but also to the history of modern capital and ethics. To apprehend the
Zong tragedy, Baucom suggests, is not to come to terms with an isolated atrocity but to encounter a logic of
violence key to the unfolding history of Atlantic modernity.

Baucom contends that the massacre and the trials that followed it bring to light an Atlantic cycle of capital
accumulation based on speculative finance, an economic cycle that has not yet run its course. The
extraordinarily abstract nature of today’s finance capital is the late-eighteenth-century system intensified.
Yet, as Baucom highlights, since the late 1700s, this rapacious speculative culture has had detractors. He
traces the emergence and development of a counter-discourse he calls melancholy realism through
abolitionist and human-rights texts, British romantic poetry, Scottish moral philosophy, and the work of late-
twentieth-century literary theorists. In revealing how the Zong tragedy resonates within contemporary
financial systems and human-rights discourses, Baucom puts forth a deeply compelling, utterly original
theory of history: one that insists that an eighteenth-century atrocity is not past but present within the future
we now inhabit.
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From reader reviews:

Ruth Nicholson:

What do you think about book? It is just for students since they are still students or the item for all people in
the world, what the best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that issue above. Every person has
various personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they don't would
like do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Specters of the Atlantic: Finance
Capital, Slavery, and the Philosophy of History. All type of book are you able to see on many resources. You
can look for the internet sources or other social media.

Christine Scott:

The particular book Specters of the Atlantic: Finance Capital, Slavery, and the Philosophy of History will
bring that you the new experience of reading a new book. The author style to clarify the idea is very unique.
Should you try to find new book you just read, this book very acceptable to you. The book Specters of the
Atlantic: Finance Capital, Slavery, and the Philosophy of History is much recommended to you to study.
You can also get the e-book from your official web site, so you can quickly to read the book.

John Johnson:

The reserve with title Specters of the Atlantic: Finance Capital, Slavery, and the Philosophy of History
includes a lot of information that you can discover it. You can get a lot of benefit after read this book. This
specific book exist new knowledge the information that exist in this guide represented the condition of the
world now. That is important to yo7u to find out how the improvement of the world. This book will bring
you throughout new era of the glowbal growth. You can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read
the idea anywhere you want.

Jennifer Powell:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many question for the book? But virtually any people feel that they enjoy with regard to reading.
Some people likes studying, not only science book but additionally novel and Specters of the Atlantic:
Finance Capital, Slavery, and the Philosophy of History or others sources were given knowledge for you.
After you know how the great a book, you feel need to read more and more. Science publication was created
for teacher or maybe students especially. Those publications are helping them to add their knowledge. In
some other case, beside science book, any other book likes Specters of the Atlantic: Finance Capital,
Slavery, and the Philosophy of History to make your spare time a lot more colorful. Many types of book like
here.
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