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The three Great Premises of Idiot America:
· Any theory is valid if it sells books, soaks up ratings, or otherwise moves units
· Anything can be true if someone says it loudly enough
· Fact is that which enough people believe. Truth is determined by how fervently they believe it
 
With his trademark wit and insight, veteran journalist Charles Pierce delivers a gut-wrenching, side-splitting
lament about the glorification of ignorance in the United States.
 
Pierce asks how a country founded on intellectual curiosity has somehow deteriorated into a nation of
simpletons more apt to vote for an American Idol contestant than a presidential candidate. But his thunderous
denunciation is also a secret call to action, as he hopes that somehow, being intelligent will stop being a
stigma, and that pinheads will once again be pitied, not celebrated. Erudite and razor-sharp, Idiot America is
at once an invigorating history lesson, a cutting cultural critique, and a bullish appeal to our smarter selves.
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From reader reviews:

Edward Strode:

Book is written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can know everything you want by a publication.
Book has a different type. As we know that book is important point to bring us around the world. Adjacent to
that you can your reading expertise was fluently. A guide Idiot America: How Stupidity Became a Virtue in
the Land of the Free will make you to become smarter. You can feel considerably more confidence if you
can know about almost everything. But some of you think that open or reading any book make you bored. It
is not necessarily make you fun. Why they might be thought like that? Have you trying to find best book or
acceptable book with you?

Deborah Hagan:

What do you about book? It is not important along? Or just adding material when you really need something
to explain what the ones you have problem? How about your time? Or are you busy man or woman? If you
don't have spare time to perform others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have time? What
did you do? All people has many questions above. They need to answer that question due to the fact just their
can do this. It said that about reserve. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is appropriate. Because start
from on jardín de infancia until university need this kind of Idiot America: How Stupidity Became a Virtue
in the Land of the Free to read.

Emily Higginbotham:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With looking at you can get a lot of
information that will give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world can easily share their
idea. Publications can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire their particular reader
with their story as well as their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the textbooks. But also they
write about advantage about something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl, or
how to teach your kids, there are many kinds of book that exist now. The authors on earth always try to
improve their expertise in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write for their book. One of
them is this Idiot America: How Stupidity Became a Virtue in the Land of the Free.

Marvin Boyer:

Idiot America: How Stupidity Became a Virtue in the Land of the Free can be one of your nice books that are
good idea. We recommend that straight away because this reserve has good vocabulary that can increase
your knowledge in terminology, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless delivering the
information. The article author giving his/her effort to put every word into satisfaction arrangement in
writing Idiot America: How Stupidity Became a Virtue in the Land of the Free although doesn't forget the
main position, giving the reader the hottest along with based confirm resource info that maybe you can be
considered one of it. This great information can easily drawn you into completely new stage of crucial



pondering.
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