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A unique work on the history and magic of the Egyptian feline goddesses, Bast and Sekhmet, from the
ancient land of majestic splendour and long-held secrets. Practising pagans Storm Constantine and Eloise
Coquio discuss the important role cats - who have been both worshipped as gods and reviled as demons -
play in many people's lives, not just as pets but as spiritual totems. A manual for magic incorporates all the
rituals the authors' circle have used, with suggestions for creating one's own, whether working solo or in
groups. Also discussed are such aspects as temple creation, attuning with your own cat familiar, and ritual
techniques. Finally, the authors suggest ways in which you can work in Bast's name in this world, such as by
'adopting' a lion or helping animal charities. Bast and Sekhmet: Eyes of Ra was written in response to the
ever-increasing popularity of and demand for information about these powerful and mysterious deities -
ancient goddesses for a new age.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Cooke:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important work, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your short lived problem;
you can add your knowledge by the publication entitled Bast and Sekhmet: Eyes of Ra. Try to stumble
through book Bast and Sekhmet: Eyes of Ra as your buddy. It means that it can to become your friend when
you truly feel alone and beside that course make you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for
yourself. The book makes you more confidence because you can know every little thing by the book. So , let
me make new experience and knowledge with this book.

Matthew Williams:

This Bast and Sekhmet: Eyes of Ra book is not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands.
The benefit you get by reading this book is definitely information inside this publication incredible fresh, you
will get data which is getting deeper a person read a lot of information you will get. This specific Bast and
Sekhmet: Eyes of Ra without we comprehend teach the one who studying it become critical in contemplating
and analyzing. Don't possibly be worry Bast and Sekhmet: Eyes of Ra can bring any time you are and not
make your bag space or bookshelves' come to be full because you can have it with your lovely laptop even
telephone. This Bast and Sekhmet: Eyes of Ra having good arrangement in word as well as layout, so you
will not truly feel uninterested in reading.

Lee Parkin:

The particular book Bast and Sekhmet: Eyes of Ra has a lot of information on it. So when you check out this
book you can get a lot of benefit. The book was compiled by the very famous author. Mcdougal makes some
research prior to write this book. This specific book very easy to read you can find the point easily after
looking over this book.

Phyllis Thompson:

Within this era which is the greater person or who has ability to do something more are more important than
other. Do you want to become one of it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you need to do is just
spending your time not very much but quite enough to experience a look at some books. One of the books in
the top checklist in your reading list is definitely Bast and Sekhmet: Eyes of Ra. This book and that is
qualified as The Hungry Hills can get you closer in getting precious person. By looking upward and review
this book you can get many advantages.
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