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Americans have been conditioned to appreciate, cheer, and serve economic growth. Brian Czech argues that,
while economic growth was a good thing for much of American history, somewhere along the way it turned
bad, depleting resources, polluting the environment, and threatening posterity. Yet growth remains a top
priority of the public and polity. In this revolutionary manifesto, Czech knocks economic growth off the
pedestal of American ideology. Seeking nothing less than a fundamental change in public opinion, Czech
makes a bold plea for castigating society’s biggest spenders and sets the stage for the "steady state
revolution."

Czech offers a sophisticated yet accessible critique of the principles of economic growth theory and the
fallacious extension of these principles into the "pop economics" of Julian Simon and others. He points with
hope to the new discipline of ecological economics, which prescribes the steady state economy as a
sustainable alternative to economic growth.

Czech explores the psychological underpinnings of our consumer culture by synthesizing theories of Charles
Darwin, Thorstein Veblen, and Abraham Maslow. Speaking to ordinary American citizens, he urges us to
recognize conspicuous consumers for who they are—bad citizens who are liquidating our grandkids’ future.
Combining insights from economics, psychology, and ecology with a large dose of common sense, Czech
drafts a blueprint for a more satisfying and sustainable society. His ideas reach deeply into our everyday
lives as he asks us to re-examine our perspectives on everything from our shopping habits to romance.

From his perspective as a wildlife ecologist, Czech draws revealing parallels between the economy of nature
and the human economy. His style is lively, easy to read, humorous, and bound to be controversial. Czech
will provoke all of us to ask when we will stop the runaway train of economic growth. His book answers the
question, "How do we do it?"
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From reader reviews:

Harvey Hobbs:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing for us
to understand everything in the world. Each book has different aim or maybe goal; it means that e-book has
different type. Some people sense enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They are really
reading whatever they take because their hobby is actually reading a book. How about the person who don't
like looking at a book? Sometime, particular person feel need book after they found difficult problem or
perhaps exercise. Well, probably you will require this Shoveling Fuel for a Runaway Train: Errant
Economists, Shameful Spenders, and a Plan to Stop them All.

Rodolfo Rodgers:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Yes, you
can choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time to take a
stroll, shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open as well as read a book allowed Shoveling
Fuel for a Runaway Train: Errant Economists, Shameful Spenders, and a Plan to Stop them All? Maybe it is
to become best activity for you. You realize beside you can spend your time with your favorite's book, you
can wiser than before. Do you agree with the opinion or you have some other opinion?

Irvin Ehlers:

Book is definitely written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can recognize everything you want by a
e-book. Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important point to bring us around the
world. Beside that you can your reading skill was fluently. A book Shoveling Fuel for a Runaway Train:
Errant Economists, Shameful Spenders, and a Plan to Stop them All will make you to possibly be smarter.
You can feel far more confidence if you can know about anything. But some of you think which open or
reading the book make you bored. It's not make you fun. Why they are often thought like that? Have you
looking for best book or appropriate book with you?

Jennifer Valdovinos:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information today can get by anyone at everywhere.
The information can be a understanding or any news even a huge concern. What people must be consider any
time those information which is within the former life are difficult to be find than now could be taking
seriously which one works to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you find the unstable
resource then you understand it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All of
those possibilities will not happen inside you if you take Shoveling Fuel for a Runaway Train: Errant
Economists, Shameful Spenders, and a Plan to Stop them All as the daily resource information.
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