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This commentary on the Letter to the Hebrews envisages the recipients of the letter as a community that has
embraced the Christian message but is beginning to question its adequacy to meet their spiritual needs. They
have given up the richness of Jewish ritual and cultic tradition for a way of life that lacks the venerable
symbols and institutions they had previously valued. Gordon highlights the arguments and rhetorical
strategies the author uses to counter this feeling of 'cultic deficit' as he draws attention to what they actually
possess in consequence of their Christian commitment. The Letter to the Hebrews has particular
contemporary relevance today because, in warning the community against 'going back', the author implies
that Christianity has superseded their ancestral Jewish faith. That may seem a slight on the religion
'superseded', but Gordon points out that Judaism itself, as well as Christianity, represents a significant break
with the religion of the Hebrew Bible/Old Testament. Jewish-Christian dialogue would profit from being
conducted in that light. For this Second Edition, the author has written an additional Introduction, and the
pagination of this edition differs from that of the first.
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From reader reviews:

William Vogt:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? That's
why, you can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their very own
spare time to take a wander, shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open or perhaps read a book
called Hebrews, Second Edition (Readings, a New Biblical Commentary)? Maybe it is for being best activity
for you. You know beside you can spend your time together with your favorite's book, you can more
intelligent than before. Do you agree with it has the opinion or you have additional opinion?

Pearlie Henry:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside with friends, fun activity using family or just
watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by studying a book. Ugh, do
you consider reading a book can actually hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It fine you
can have the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like Hebrews, Second Edition
(Readings, a New Biblical Commentary) which is having the e-book version. So , why not try out this book?
Let's observe.

Corey Gardner:

You can find this Hebrews, Second Edition (Readings, a New Biblical Commentary) by browse the
bookstore or Mall. Just viewing or reviewing it may to be your solve problem if you get difficulties for your
knowledge. Kinds of this reserve are various. Not only simply by written or printed but can you enjoy this
book by e-book. In the modern era such as now, you just looking of your mobile phone and searching what
their problem. Right now, choose your own personal ways to get more information about your guide. It is
most important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still upgrade. Let's try to choose suitable
ways for you.

Donald White:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got learners? We believe that that query was
given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. And you know that
little person similar to reading or as studying become their hobby. You need to know that reading is very
important along with book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to provide you knowledge, except your
personal teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update with regards to something by book. Numerous
books that can you go onto be your object. One of them is this Hebrews, Second Edition (Readings, a New
Biblical Commentary).
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