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Is there a God? What is the evidence for belief in such a being? What is God like? Or, is God a figment of
human inspiration? How do we know that such a being might not exist? Should belief or disbelief in God's
existence make a difference in our opinions and moral choices, in the way we see ourselves and relate to
those around us?

These are fundamental questions, and their answers have shaped individual lives, races, and nations
throughout history. On March 24, 1988, at the University of Mississippi, J.P. Moreland, a leading Christian
philosopher and ethicist, and Kai Nielsen, one of today's best-known atheist philosophers, went head-to-head
over these questions.

Does God Exist? records their entire lively debate and includes questions from the audience, the debaters'
answers, and the responses of four recognized scholars - William Lane Craig, Antony Flew, Dallas Willard,
and Keith Parsons. Noted author and philosopher Peter Kreeft has written an introduction, concluding
chapter, and appendix - all designed to help readers decide for themselves whether God is fact or fantasy.
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From reader reviews:

Jeremy Gable:

Throughout other case, little individuals like to read book Does God Exist?. You can choose the best book if
you love reading a book. Given that we know about how is important any book Does God Exist?. You can
add understanding and of course you can around the world by a book. Absolutely right, simply because from
book you can learn everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you can be known. About simple
thing until wonderful thing you may know that. In this era, we could open a book or maybe searching by
internet system. It is called e-book. You should use it when you feel bored stiff to go to the library. Let's
read.

Cristen Washington:

What do you think of book? It is just for students as they are still students or the item for all people in the
world, the particular best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that query above. Every
person has different personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they
don't would like do that. You must know how great along with important the book Does God Exist?. All type
of book would you see on many methods. You can look for the internet methods or other social media.

Carlton Little:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children until eventually adult are different content. As you
may know that book is very important for us. The book Does God Exist? ended up being making you to
know about other know-how and of course you can take more information. It is quite advantages for you.
The guide Does God Exist? is not only giving you much more new information but also to get your friend
when you truly feel bored. You can spend your current spend time to read your book. Try to make
relationship with all the book Does God Exist?. You never really feel lose out for everything if you read
some books.

Hoyt Knapp:

This Does God Exist? usually are reliable for you who want to certainly be a successful person, why. The
main reason of this Does God Exist? can be on the list of great books you must have is usually giving you
more than just simple studying food but feed anyone with information that maybe will shock your prior
knowledge. This book is usually handy, you can bring it everywhere you go and whenever your conditions at
e-book and printed people. Beside that this Does God Exist? forcing you to have an enormous of experience
including rich vocabulary, giving you test of critical thinking that we know it useful in your day pastime. So ,
let's have it and revel in reading.
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