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During the Cold War, deterrence theory was the cornerstone of U.S. foreign policy. Following the 9/11
terrorist attacks, however, popular wisdom dictated that terrorist organizations and radical fanatics could not
be deterred—and governments shifted their attention to combating terrorism rather than deterring it.

This book challenges that prevailing assumption and offers insight as to when and where terrorism can be
deterred. It first identifies how and where theories of deterrence apply to counterterrorism, highlighting how
traditional and less-traditional notions of deterrence can be applied to evolving terrorist threats. It then
applies these theoretical propositions to real-world threats to establish the role deterrence has within a
dynamic counterterrorism strategy—and to identify how metrics can be created for measuring the success of
terrorism deterrence strategies. In sum, it provides a foundation for developing effective counterterrorism
policies to help states contain or curtail the terrorism challenges they face.
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From reader reviews:

Bobby Bagwell:

Now a day those who Living in the era exactly where everything reachable by connect to the internet and the
resources within it can be true or not need people to be aware of each information they get. How many
people to be smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Examining a
book can help folks out of this uncertainty Information specially this Deterring Terrorism: Theory and
Practice (Stanford Security Studies) book since this book offers you rich data and knowledge. Of course the
info in this book hundred per-cent guarantees there is no doubt in it as you know.

Thomas Manna:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also become a life style. This
reading behavior give you lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge the actual
information inside the book in which improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on
what kind of publication you read, if you want send more knowledge just go with training books but if you
want feel happy read one along with theme for entertaining for example comic or novel. Often the Deterring
Terrorism: Theory and Practice (Stanford Security Studies) is kind of guide which is giving the reader
unpredictable experience.

Sandra Fritz:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside together with friends, fun activity with family or
just watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by studying a book.
Ugh, think reading a book will surely hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It fine you can
have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like Deterring Terrorism: Theory and
Practice (Stanford Security Studies) which is having the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's
see.

Alexander Goodman:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got scholars? We believe that that question
was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. Therefore you
know that little person just like reading or as reading become their hobby. You need to understand that
reading is very important along with book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to include you
knowledge, except your own teacher or lecturer. You will find good news or update with regards to
something by book. A substantial number of sorts of books that can you choose to adopt be your object. One
of them is this Deterring Terrorism: Theory and Practice (Stanford Security Studies).
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