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Western culture has long been fascinated by black women, but a history of enslavement and colonial
conquest has variously labeled black women's bodies as "exotic" and "grotesque." In this remarkable cultural
history of black female beauty, Janell Hobson explores the enduring figure of the "Hottentot Venus."

In 1810, Saartjie Baartman was taken from South Africa to Europe, where she was put on display at circuses,
salons, and museums and universities as the "Hottentot Venus." The subsequent legacy of representations of
black women's sexuality-from Josephine Baker to Serena Williams to hip-hop and dancehall videos-
continues to refer back to this persistent icon. This book analyzes the history of critical and artistic responses
to this iconography by black women in contemporary photography, film, literature, music, and dance.
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From reader reviews:

Alysha Johnson:

Book is actually written, printed, or created for everything. You can know everything you want by a guide.
Book has a different type. As we know that book is important issue to bring us around the world. Close to
that you can your reading skill was fluently. A e-book Venus in the Dark: Blackness and Beauty in Popular
Culture will make you to end up being smarter. You can feel considerably more confidence if you can know
about every thing. But some of you think that open or reading any book make you bored. It isn't make you
fun. Why they may be thought like that? Have you seeking best book or ideal book with you?

Allison Phelps:

Here thing why that Venus in the Dark: Blackness and Beauty in Popular Culture are different and
trustworthy to be yours. First of all looking at a book is good but it depends in the content of it which is the
content is as delightful as food or not. Venus in the Dark: Blackness and Beauty in Popular Culture giving
you information deeper and different ways, you can find any book out there but there is no publication that
similar with Venus in the Dark: Blackness and Beauty in Popular Culture. It gives you thrill examining
journey, its open up your eyes about the thing that will happened in the world which is possibly can be
happened around you. You can bring everywhere like in area, café, or even in your means home by train. If
you are having difficulties in bringing the printed book maybe the form of Venus in the Dark: Blackness and
Beauty in Popular Culture in e-book can be your choice.

James Horowitz:

Many people spending their time period by playing outside together with friends, fun activity with family or
just watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by reading through a
book. Ugh, do you consider reading a book will surely hard because you have to bring the book everywhere?
It fine you can have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Cell phone. Like Venus in the Dark:
Blackness and Beauty in Popular Culture which is finding the e-book version. So , why not try out this book?
Let's find.

Richard Ma:

Reserve is one of source of know-how. We can add our knowledge from it. Not only for students but in
addition native or citizen require book to know the revise information of year to be able to year. As we know
those publications have many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, could also bring us to around
the world. By book Venus in the Dark: Blackness and Beauty in Popular Culture we can acquire more
advantage. Don't you to be creative people? For being creative person must love to read a book. Just simply
choose the best book that appropriate with your aim. Don't become doubt to change your life with that book
Venus in the Dark: Blackness and Beauty in Popular Culture. You can more attractive than now.
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