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By the end of the Civil War, Champ Ferguson had become a notorious criminal whose likeness covered the
front pages of Harper’s Weekly, Leslie’s Illustrated, and other newspapers across the country. His crime?
Using the war as an excuse to steal, plunder, and murder Union civilians and soldiers.

Cumberland Blood: Champ Ferguson’s Civil War offers insights into Ferguson's lawless brutality and a
lesser-known aspect of the Civil War, the bitter guerrilla conflict in the Appalachian highlands, extending
from the Carolinas through Tennessee, Kentucky, Virginia, and West Virginia. This compelling volume
delves into the violent story of Champ Ferguson, who acted independently of the Confederate army in a
personal war that eventually garnered the censure of Confederate officials.

Author Thomas D. Mays traces Ferguson's life in the Cumberland highlands of southern Kentucky,
where—even before the Civil War began—he had a reputation as a vicious killer.

Ferguson, a rising slave owner, sided with the Confederacy while many of his neighbors and family
members took up arms for the Union. For Ferguson and others in the highlands, the war would not be
decided on the distant fields of Shiloh or Gettysburg: it would be local—and personal.

Cumberland Blood describes how Unionists drove Ferguson from his home in Kentucky into Tennessee,
where he banded together with other like-minded Southerners to drive the Unionists from the region.
Northern sympathizers responded, and a full-scale guerrilla war erupted along the border in 1862. Mays
notes that Ferguson's status in the army was never clear, and he skillfully details how raiders picked up
Ferguson's gang to work as guides and scouts. In 1864, Ferguson and his gang were incorporated into the
Confederate army, but the rogue soldier continued operating as an outlaw, murdering captured Union
prisoners after the Battle of Saltville, Virginia.

Cumberland Blood, enhanced by twenty-one illustrations, is an illuminating assessment of one of the Civil
War's most ruthless men.

Ferguson's arrest, trial, and execution after the war captured the attention of the nation in



1865, but his story has been largely forgotten. Cumberland Blood: Champ Ferguson's Civil War returns the
story of Ferguson's private civil war to its place in history.
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From reader reviews:

Lila Smith:

What do you think of book? It is just for students since they are still students or it for all people in the world,
the particular best subject for that? Just simply you can be answered for that problem above. Every person
has various personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that
they don't need do that. You must know how great as well as important the book Cumberland Blood: Champ
Ferguson's Civil War. All type of book would you see on many options. You can look for the internet
sources or other social media.

Jewel Williams:

Often the book Cumberland Blood: Champ Ferguson's Civil War will bring that you the new experience of
reading a new book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique. In case you try to find new book to
learn, this book very appropriate to you. The book Cumberland Blood: Champ Ferguson's Civil War is much
recommended to you to see. You can also get the e-book from your official web site, so you can more easily
to read the book.

Judith Ellis:

Spent a free time and energy to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their spare time with their
family, or their friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, likely to beach, or picnic
inside park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you wish to something different to fill
your current free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book can be option to fill your totally free time/ holiday.
The first thing you ask may be what kinds of guide that you should read. If you want to attempt look for
book, may be the guide untitled Cumberland Blood: Champ Ferguson's Civil War can be great book to read.
May be it could be best activity to you.

David Cormier:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with close friends is thing
that usually you may have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try issue that really
opposite from that. One particular activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on
roller coaster you are ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love Cumberland Blood: Champ
Ferguson's Civil War, you may enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still would like to miss it? What
kind of hang-out type is it? Oh can occur its mind hangout folks. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its
named reading friends.
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