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Guides for an Age of Confusion compares and contrasts the views of the two great Jewish philosophers
Avraham Y. Kook and Mordecai M. Kaplan. Although these two thinkers stand at opposite ends of the
spectrum of Jewish thought, they are united in their love for the Jewish people and in their belief in the need
for Jewish unity. Following an introduction to both men, the author, a disciple of Kaplan's, explores their
views regarding some of the most important issues confronting the Jewish people today. These include
traditions such as Israel's chosenness; the status of the Halakhah, traditional Jewish law, in today's society;
prayer and its revitalization; repentance (Teshuvah) leading to the return to God; and the role of Eretz Yisrael
in the life of the Jewish people. Other topics covered are the idea of and the search for God, the position of
women in Jewish society, and philosophies of education, along with an exploration of esthetics in Jewish life
and the challenges of democracy. Each chapter provides an overview of the subject and then discusses the
divergent views of the two thinkers, as well as their areas of agreement. Finally, the book endeavors to
portray the future of Jewish life as envisaged through the eyes of these two great men. In the author's view, a
dialogue must be established between the followers of both Kook and Kaplan. Only in this way can Jewish
solidarity be maintained and the Jewish future secured. This book is an effort to open that dialogue.
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From reader reviews:

Ray Ellis:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important behave, like
looking for your favorite book and reading a book. Beside you can solve your problem; you can add your
knowledge by the reserve entitled Guides For an Age of Confusion: Studies in the Thinking of Avraham Y.
Kook and Mordecai M. Kaplan. Try to the actual book Guides For an Age of Confusion: Studies in the
Thinking of Avraham Y. Kook and Mordecai M. Kaplan as your pal. It means that it can to be your friend
when you really feel alone and beside that of course make you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned
in your case. The book makes you more confidence because you can know every little thing by the book. So ,
let's make new experience and also knowledge with this book.

Robert Stitt:

What do you in relation to book? It is not important along with you? Or just adding material if you want
something to explain what yours problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy particular person? If
you don't have spare time to complete others business, it is make one feel bored faster. And you have time?
What did you do? Every individual has many questions above. They should answer that question mainly
because just their can do that will. It said that about publication. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is
correct. Because start from on pre-school until university need this specific Guides For an Age of Confusion:
Studies in the Thinking of Avraham Y. Kook and Mordecai M. Kaplan to read.

Gail Beattie:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information presently can get by anyone at everywhere.
The information can be a expertise or any news even a problem. What people must be consider if those
information which is inside the former life are difficult to be find than now is taking seriously which one is
acceptable to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you obtain the unstable resource
then you buy it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities
will not happen with you if you take Guides For an Age of Confusion: Studies in the Thinking of Avraham
Y. Kook and Mordecai M. Kaplan as the daily resource information.

Shane Dagostino:

You are able to spend your free time to study this book this book. This Guides For an Age of Confusion:
Studies in the Thinking of Avraham Y. Kook and Mordecai M. Kaplan is simple to develop you can read it
in the park your car, in the beach, train as well as soon. If you did not have much space to bring the actual
printed book, you can buy typically the e-book. It is make you quicker to read it. You can save the book in
your smart phone. So there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.
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