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In small, stunningly rendered self–portraits, Mexican artist Frida Kahlo painted herself cracked open,
hemorrhaging during a miscarriage, anesthetized on a hospital gurney, and weeping beside her own extracted
heart.

Her works are so incendiary in emotion and subject matter that one art critic suggested the walls of an
exhibition be covered with asbestos.

In this beautiful book, art historian Hayden Herrera brings together numerous paintings and sketches by the
amazing Mexican artist, documenting each with explanatory text that probes the influences in Kahlo‘s life
and their meaning for her work. Included among the illustrations are more than eighty full–color paintings,
as well as dozens of black–and–white pictures and line illustrations. Among the famous and little–known
works included in Frida Kahlo: The Paintings are The Two Fridas, Self–Portrait as a Tehuana, Without
Hope, The Dream, The Little Deer, Diego and I, Henry Ford Hospital, My Birth, and My Nurse and I. Here,
too, are documentary photographs of Frida Kahlo and her world that help to illuminate the various stages of
her life.
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From reader reviews:

Alexandra Sauer:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a publication will give you a lot of
new details. When you read a guide you will get new information because book is one of many ways to share
the information or perhaps their idea. Second, examining a book will make an individual more imaginative.
When you reading a book especially hype book the author will bring that you imagine the story how the
figures do it anything. Third, you can share your knowledge to other people. When you read this Frida
Kahlo: The Paintings, you are able to tells your family, friends and soon about yours publication. Your
knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading a publication.

Shirley Martins:

The e-book with title Frida Kahlo: The Paintings includes a lot of information that you can learn it. You can
get a lot of gain after read this book. This book exist new understanding the information that exist in this
reserve represented the condition of the world currently. That is important to yo7u to know how the
improvement of the world. This book will bring you with new era of the syndication. You can read the e-
book in your smart phone, so you can read that anywhere you want.

Jack Caldwell:

You can get this Frida Kahlo: The Paintings by check out the bookstore or Mall. Merely viewing or
reviewing it might to be your solve challenge if you get difficulties for ones knowledge. Kinds of this book
are various. Not only by simply written or printed but additionally can you enjoy this book simply by e-book.
In the modern era like now, you just looking by your local mobile phone and searching what their problem.
Right now, choose your ways to get more information about your e-book. It is most important to arrange you
to ultimately make your knowledge are still update. Let's try to choose suitable ways for you.

Preston Garza:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many issue for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people likes
studying, not only science book but in addition novel and Frida Kahlo: The Paintings or maybe others
sources were given know-how for you. After you know how the fantastic a book, you feel want to read more
and more. Science book was created for teacher or maybe students especially. Those guides are helping them
to bring their knowledge. In other case, beside science book, any other book likes Frida Kahlo: The Paintings
to make your spare time much more colorful. Many types of book like this.
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