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How did a barren, thinly populated country, somewhat isolated from the rest of Europe, establish itself as the
world's first superpower? Henry Kamen's impressive new book offers a fresh and highly original answer.

Empire is a global survey of the two and a halt centuries (from the late fifteenth to the mid-eighteenth) in
which the Spaniards established the most extensive empire the world had ever known, ranging from Naples
and the Netherlands to the Philippines. Unlike previous accounts, which have presented the Empire as a
direct consequence of Spanish power, this provocative work of history emphasizes the inability of Spain to
run an imperial enterprise by itself The role of conquest was deceptive. Spain's rise to power was actually
made possible by the collaboration of international business interests, including Italian financiers, German
technicians and Dutch traders, in the task of setting up networks of contact ranging across the oceans. At the
height of its apparent power, the Spanish Empire was in reality a global enterprise in which non-Spaniards --
Portuguese, Basque, Aztec, Genoese, Chinese, Flemish, West African, Incan and Neapolitan -- played an
essential role. It is this vast diversity of resources and people (which included many of its greatest
adventurers and soldiers) that made Spain's power so overwhelming.

There is no better account in English of this time. Henry Kamen's book provides a highly relevant analysis of
the origins and nature of imperial power, and of global economic activity. Challenging, persuasive and
unique in its thesis, Empire explores Spain's complex impact on world history with admirable clarity and
intelligence.
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From reader reviews:

Thomas Murray:

This Empire: How Spain Became a World Power, 1492-1763 book is just not ordinary book, you have it then
the world is in your hands. The benefit you receive by reading this book will be information inside this e-
book incredible fresh, you will get data which is getting deeper an individual read a lot of information you
will get. This kind of Empire: How Spain Became a World Power, 1492-1763 without we recognize teach
the one who reading it become critical in imagining and analyzing. Don't always be worry Empire: How
Spain Became a World Power, 1492-1763 can bring any time you are and not make your bag space or
bookshelves' grow to be full because you can have it in your lovely laptop even phone. This Empire: How
Spain Became a World Power, 1492-1763 having very good arrangement in word as well as layout, so you
will not really feel uninterested in reading.

Bobbie Burke:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book ended up being rare?
Why so many concern for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy for reading. Some people
likes examining, not only science book and also novel and Empire: How Spain Became a World Power,
1492-1763 or perhaps others sources were given understanding for you. After you know how the truly great
a book, you feel desire to read more and more. Science guide was created for teacher or perhaps students
especially. Those guides are helping them to add their knowledge. In various other case, beside science
guide, any other book likes Empire: How Spain Became a World Power, 1492-1763 to make your spare time
considerably more colorful. Many types of book like this.

Molly Wilson:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library or to
make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's internal or real
their passion. They just do what the trainer want, like asked to go to the library. They go to at this time there
but nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring and can't see colorful
photos on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important to suit your needs. As we know
that on this period, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's
country. Therefore this Empire: How Spain Became a World Power, 1492-1763 can make you experience
more interested to read.

Tommy Wright:

A number of people said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a guide. They are directly felt this when
they get a half regions of the book. You can choose the particular book Empire: How Spain Became a World
Power, 1492-1763 to make your personal reading is interesting. Your personal skill of reading skill is
developing when you similar to reading. Try to choose very simple book to make you enjoy to see it and



mingle the impression about book and examining especially. It is to be first opinion for you to like to open a
book and learn it. Beside that the publication Empire: How Spain Became a World Power, 1492-1763 can to
be your new friend when you're really feel alone and confuse in what must you're doing of this time.
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