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"Charles Van Doren has laid a feast before all of us that is irresistible." -Mortimer J. Adler

This engaging love letter to reading follows the great authors and classics that transformed the world: from
Aristotle and Herodotus in ancient Greece to Salinger and Heinlein in 20th century America. Like a
professor whose enthusiasm enwraps his students, Van Doren explains what's wonderful in the books you've
missed and awakens your desire to reopen the books you already know.

Divided chronologically by the periods in which these classics were written, each book is put in its historical
context and brought to life by Van Doren's brilliant analysis. The Joy of Reading delves into a wide range of
genres-fiction, poetry, drama, children's books, philosophy, history and science. This is the one book that
brings together everything you need to know about the classics you missed and ignites your passion to read
and reread the greatest books the world has ever known.

This book is the fruit of a lifelong love affair. Reading, I believe, is my favorite thing to do; books and I have
been inseparable almost as long as I can remember ... To this day, I become distressed if I am anywhere
without a book, a magazine, a newspaper, any scrap of paper to read .... I like the smell of books, certainly
the feel of them. Life without books would be, for me, a vacant horror."
-Charles Van Doren

"Nothing recommends the joy of reading better than the communication of it by a person who has spent a
lifetime enriched by the delights of reading. Charles Van Doren is that kind of reader. He has laid a feast
before us that is irresistible."
-Mortimer J. Adler, author of How to Read a Book

"Mr. Van Doren is that rarity, a truly well read man who reads not for professional purposes but for pleasure.
His book spurs us on to explore more deeply and joyfully the infinitely varied terrain of good books."
-Clifton Fadiman, author of The New Lifetime Reading Plan: The Classical Guide to World Literature
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From reader reviews:

Maria Lacher:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have far more or little spare time? Yeah, you can
choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time to take a
stroll, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or even read a book called The Joy of
Reading: A Passionate Guide to 189 of the World's Best Authors and Their Works? Maybe it is being best
activity for you. You already know beside you can spend your time using your favorite's book, you can better
than before. Do you agree with the opinion or you have some other opinion?

Rebecca Walton:

As people who live in often the modest era should be up-date about what going on or info even knowledge to
make these keep up with the era and that is always change and advance. Some of you maybe may update
themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice for you but the problems coming to you is you
don't know which you should start with. This The Joy of Reading: A Passionate Guide to 189 of the World's
Best Authors and Their Works is our recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why, since this
book serves what you want and need in this era.

Richard Strohm:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always aim to and must have the extra time or they will get wide
range of stress from both day to day life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have time, we will say
absolutely sure. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity are you
experiencing when the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer will unlimited right. Then
do you ever try this one, reading publications. It can be your alternative within spending your spare time,
typically the book you have read is The Joy of Reading: A Passionate Guide to 189 of the World's Best
Authors and Their Works.

Jean Taylor:

You may get this The Joy of Reading: A Passionate Guide to 189 of the World's Best Authors and Their
Works by browse the bookstore or Mall. Just simply viewing or reviewing it can to be your solve problem if
you get difficulties for the knowledge. Kinds of this book are various. Not only through written or printed
but in addition can you enjoy this book by means of e-book. In the modern era such as now, you just looking
by your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your own personal ways to get
more information about your guide. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge
are still revise. Let's try to choose suitable ways for you.
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