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Designed to serve as a basic text for an introductory course in Public Administration, this innovative work
provides students with an understanding of the basic management functions that are covered in all standard
textbooks with two important differences.

First, it is written to address the needs of both the experienced practitioner and the entry-level public servant.
Case examples bridge the content-rich environment of practitioners with the basic principles of public
administration sought by pre-service students.

Second, the discussion of basic management practices is grounded in the political and ethical tensions
inherent in the American constitutional form of governance. This reflects the authors' belief that public
administration operates as an integral part of the country's political traditions, and thereby helps define the
political culture. The book provides a framework for understanding American political traditions and how
they inform public administration as a political practice.

Key Changes in the Second Edition include:

A new introductory chapter that explains what the authors mean by a constitutional approach and why that●

is important.< /li>
An expanded discussion of the role of civil society in promoting the common good.●

A new section in chapter 5 on New Public Governance.●

Updated exhibits that incorporate up-to-date census data and revenue figures (chapter 10).●

A new section in chapter 14 that recognises the importance of maintaining accountability in contract and●

networked systems of governance.
Significantly rewritten chapters to add emphasis on the relevance of the chapter material to nonprofit●

organisations.
A significantly revised bibliography which incorporates new bodies of research that have appeared since●

the first edition.
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From reader reviews:

Larry Parrish:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students as they are still students or this for all people in the
world, what the best subject for that? Just you can be answered for that issue above. Every person has
various personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that they don't
would like do that. You must know how great and also important the book Foundations of Public Service.
All type of book are you able to see on many solutions. You can look for the internet options or other social
media.

Ryan Moore:

This Foundations of Public Service tend to be reliable for you who want to be considered a successful
person, why. The reason why of this Foundations of Public Service can be one of many great books you must
have is definitely giving you more than just simple looking at food but feed you with information that
probably will shock your prior knowledge. This book is handy, you can bring it almost everywhere and
whenever your conditions at e-book and printed kinds. Beside that this Foundations of Public Service forcing
you to have an enormous of experience for example rich vocabulary, giving you trial of critical thinking that
we all know it useful in your day task. So , let's have it and enjoy reading.

Tara Winston:

The book untitled Foundations of Public Service is the e-book that recommended to you to read. You can see
the quality of the book content that will be shown to a person. The language that writer use to explained their
ideas are easily to understand. The article author was did a lot of research when write the book, hence the
information that they share to you personally is absolutely accurate. You also could possibly get the e-book
of Foundations of Public Service from the publisher to make you a lot more enjoy free time.

Jose Rivera:

Do you like reading a e-book? Confuse to looking for your favorite book? Or your book was rare? Why so
many concern for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people likes
reading, not only science book but also novel and Foundations of Public Service or others sources were
given knowledge for you. After you know how the great a book, you feel wish to read more and more.
Science guide was created for teacher or even students especially. Those guides are helping them to include
their knowledge. In other case, beside science book, any other book likes Foundations of Public Service to
make your spare time much more colorful. Many types of book like this.
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