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"Drenda Howatt has transparently combined personal notes from emails and social media to create a new
kind of journal; one that allows family and friends to comment on your inner-most 'posts.' What emerges is a
fascinating journey of hope through one of today's biggest battles. The love and encouragement of family
and friends reaches beyond the page. Howatt's faith grows before the reader's eyes and transforms us with
her brutal honesty and resolve." - Kim Seeds de Blecourt, Author of A Willing Hostage This book is a
journey. A journey that is relayed to you through my e-mails and Facebook postings. It is a normal life,
interspersed with breast cancer. After I learned I had cancer, I used Facebook notes to update my family and
friends on the status of my treatment. But before long, my notes changed from merely updates to more
commentary on the things happening to me, and the people surrounding me. As hundreds of my friends can
attest, it is an emotional 'read.' Believe me, it was an emotional 'write.' I used the words "strong and
courageous" in my Facebook status update on November 11, 2008 as I awaited my diagnosis. Not that I was
'strong and courageous' by any measurement. It was that I would be. I would be 'strong and
courageous'...willing those traits to be present amid the terror. Those words have taken on a life of their own.
You'll read about where they came from (Joshua 1:9). Those dear family and friends that came alongside to
support me used those same words to encourage me when I could not get up and go another moment. Team
Strong and Courageous was 43 members strong at Walk for the Cure on September 20, 2009. Strong and
Courageous. "Have I not commanded you? Be strong and courageous. Do not be terrified. Do not be
discouraged. For the Lord your God is with you wherever you go." Joshua 1:9
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From reader reviews:

Coleman Jones:

The event that you get from Strong and Courageous: A Survivor's Facebook Journey Through Breast Cancer
could be the more deep you rooting the information that hide inside the words the more you get enthusiastic
about reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is hard to recognise but Strong and Courageous: A Survivor's
Facebook Journey Through Breast Cancer giving you buzz feeling of reading. The article author conveys
their point in certain way that can be understood by simply anyone who read it because the author of this
guide is well-known enough. That book also makes your vocabulary increase well. So it is easy to
understand then can go along, both in printed or e-book style are available. We recommend you for having
this specific Strong and Courageous: A Survivor's Facebook Journey Through Breast Cancer instantly.

Rick Braden:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like reading
book therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a book will give you a lot of
new details. When you read a book you will get new information mainly because book is one of numerous
ways to share the information or their idea. Second, reading a book will make a person more imaginative.
When you reading a book especially fictional book the author will bring you to definitely imagine the story
how the characters do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to other individuals. When
you read this Strong and Courageous: A Survivor's Facebook Journey Through Breast Cancer, you are able
to tells your family, friends along with soon about yours publication. Your knowledge can inspire the others,
make them reading a e-book.

Brian Rutt:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or go to the outside with them loved ones
or their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, or maybe
playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity that is look different you can
read a book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can spent 24 hours a
day to reading a e-book. The book Strong and Courageous: A Survivor's Facebook Journey Through Breast
Cancer it is very good to read. There are a lot of people who recommended this book. These people were
enjoying reading this book. If you did not have enough space bringing this book you can buy the particular
e-book. You can m0ore easily to read this book through your smart phone. The price is not to fund but this
book possesses high quality.

Sherri King:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is published or printed or descriptive from each source that filled update of
news. In this modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From



media social just like newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic.
You can add your understanding by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to spread out your
book? Or just looking for the Strong and Courageous: A Survivor's Facebook Journey Through Breast
Cancer when you needed it?
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