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When Celia Donnelly’s husband, Jonathon, surprises her with a family vacation to Mexico, the harried book
editor couldn't be happier. She is overworked and exhausted, a situation that has taken a toll on her eighteen-
year marriage, not to mention her relationship with her teenaged son. Escaping the perpetually rainy Pacific
Northwest for the sugary sands of Mexico could be just what the doctor ordered. Yet shortly after their
arrival south of the border, a chance encounter with a stranger sparks illicit memories of a former affair. The
moment passes, but that brief encounter proves enough to change her life forever. Hours later, Celia is lured
from the beach and abducted off the street. At first a seemingly random victim, Celia quickly realizes her
captors know exactly who she is. Desperate for news of her family and devastated by the betrayal of
someone she trusts, Celia, along with an unlikely ally, is soon running for her life. Pursued from the balmy
shores of Mexico to the steamy thickets of the jungle, to the crisp, cold mountains of Zurich, Celia will stop
at nothing to find her way home.

A Small Fortune is the gripping first book in the Fortune Series, find out what happens next in Fortune’s
Deadly Decent.
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From reader reviews:

Helen Henson:

In other case, little people like to read book A Small Fortune (Fortune Series). You can choose the best book
if you like reading a book. As long as we know about how is important the book A Small Fortune (Fortune
Series). You can add information and of course you can around the world by way of a book. Absolutely
right, because from book you can know everything! From your country until foreign or abroad you will end
up known. About simple issue until wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, we can easily open a
book or maybe searching by internet device. It is called e-book. You may use it when you feel bored to go to
the library. Let's read.

Steven Resnick:

Here thing why this kind of A Small Fortune (Fortune Series) are different and trustworthy to be yours. First
of all examining a book is good but it depends in the content of the usb ports which is the content is as
delightful as food or not. A Small Fortune (Fortune Series) giving you information deeper and in different
ways, you can find any guide out there but there is no publication that similar with A Small Fortune (Fortune
Series). It gives you thrill studying journey, its open up your eyes about the thing this happened in the world
which is probably can be happened around you. It is easy to bring everywhere like in playground, café, or
even in your method home by train. Should you be having difficulties in bringing the imprinted book maybe
the form of A Small Fortune (Fortune Series) in e-book can be your substitute.

Maureen Bonds:

A Small Fortune (Fortune Series) can be one of your starter books that are good idea. We all recommend that
straight away because this reserve has good vocabulary that could increase your knowledge in terminology,
easy to understand, bit entertaining but nonetheless delivering the information. The article writer giving
his/her effort to place every word into joy arrangement in writing A Small Fortune (Fortune Series) however
doesn't forget the main point, giving the reader the hottest along with based confirm resource details that
maybe you can be certainly one of it. This great information may drawn you into brand new stage of crucial
considering.

Aaron Tolleson:

Do you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book store?
Attempt to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't evaluate book by its include may
doesn't work is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the outside
appearance likes. Maybe you answer may be A Small Fortune (Fortune Series) why because the wonderful
cover that make you consider concerning the content will not disappoint you actually. The inside or content
is usually fantastic as the outside or maybe cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly show you to pick up
this book.
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