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In 1775 Cherokee leaders sold most of Tennessee and Kentucky to the recently arrived white settlers, but
Dragging Canoe, a proud chief, said that the sacred land should not be defiled by the white man's ax and
plow. "This is the Dark and Bloody Ground!" he proclaimed to the assembled chiefs.

Perhaps it is the abundance of decaying mansions that harbor dark and sinister secrets, or perhaps it is
Tennessee's tragic heritage of war and defeat, or it may just be the love of a good story that accounts for the
fact that Tennessee is steeped in strange tales. Each of these 40 accounts has been exhaustively researched
and is presented as accurately as possible, inclulding:

The day in 1877 when it rained foot-long snakes in Memphis●

The arch rivals who are buried in the state capitol building; on quiet nights one can still hear them arguing●

Elvis's ghost, who visits Graceland in the early morning in his black limousine●

The mathematics professor from the University of Nashville who suddenly burst into flames●

Andrew Jackson's encounter with the infamous Bell Witch●

The vampire found in Bradley County, with a wooden stake through her heart●

The day a UFO buzzed Huntsville, Chattanooga, and Knoxville●
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From reader reviews:

Lana Spalding:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive now, people have do
something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place and notice
by surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated that for a while is reading.
That's why, by reading a guide your ability to survive raise then having chance to stand than other is high. To
suit your needs who want to start reading any book, we give you this Strange Tales of the Dark and Bloody
Ground: Authentic Accounts of Restless Spirits, Haunted Honky Tonks, and Eerie Events in Tennessee book
as beginner and daily reading book. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Tina McKinney:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading
addiction give you lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge the actual information
inside the book which improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of
reserve you read, if you want drive more knowledge just go with education books but if you want feel happy
read one together with theme for entertaining including comic or novel. Often the Strange Tales of the Dark
and Bloody Ground: Authentic Accounts of Restless Spirits, Haunted Honky Tonks, and Eerie Events in
Tennessee is kind of e-book which is giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Dennis Mock:

Typically the book Strange Tales of the Dark and Bloody Ground: Authentic Accounts of Restless Spirits,
Haunted Honky Tonks, and Eerie Events in Tennessee will bring you to the new experience of reading some
sort of book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique. If you try to find new book to study, this
book very ideal to you. The book Strange Tales of the Dark and Bloody Ground: Authentic Accounts of
Restless Spirits, Haunted Honky Tonks, and Eerie Events in Tennessee is much recommended to you you
just read. You can also get the e-book from the official web site, so you can quicker to read the book.

Myra McKenzie:

As a college student exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library in
order to make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's internal or
real their interest. They just do what the trainer want, like asked to go to the library. They go to generally
there but nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring and
can't see colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important for you. As we
know that on this period, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word says, many ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore this Strange Tales of the Dark and Bloody Ground: Authentic Accounts of
Restless Spirits, Haunted Honky Tonks, and Eerie Events in Tennessee can make you truly feel more
interested to read.
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