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“A stimulating look at two of today’s most controversial subjects. . . . Sure to amaze and titillate anyone
who’s ever hoisted a videogame controller.”—CNN Tech Correspondent Scott Steinberg

No book until Porn & Pong has explored how pornography and video games have influenced America’s
sexual mores and technological compulsions on a massive scale.

The first Atari systems and their phallic joysticks began to sell by the million along with the rise of the VCR
and the modern porn industry. Reality TV skyrocketed the same year as The Sims, and the surgically
endowed Pamela Anderson was only outshined by one other woman: Lara Croft.

Porn & Pong’s publication comes at the time of the release of several highly anticipated adult-oriented
games, including a new Leisure Suit Larry, Tomb Raider, and the sequel to the most controversial video
game of all time, Grand Theft Auto. Author Damon Brown examines how politics, hidden agendas, and
financial pressure affect the controversial art forms of gaming and pornography.

Damon Brown writes for Playboy, Spin, New York Post, and the Inspector Gadget column for PlanetOut, the
largest gay and lesbian website.
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From reader reviews:

Edward Kirklin:

Inside other case, little people like to read book Porn & Pong: How Grand Theft Auto, Tomb Raider and
other Sexy Games Changed Our Culture. You can choose the best book if you want reading a book.
Providing we know about how is important some sort of book Porn & Pong: How Grand Theft Auto, Tomb
Raider and other Sexy Games Changed Our Culture. You can add understanding and of course you can
around the world by a book. Absolutely right, simply because from book you can realize everything! From
your country until finally foreign or abroad you will find yourself known. About simple factor until
wonderful thing you can know that. In this era, we are able to open a book or searching by internet product.
It is called e-book. You may use it when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's learn.

Clyde Miller:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students since they are still students or it for all people in the
world, exactly what the best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that concern above. Every
person has diverse personality and hobby per other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they don't
wish do that. You must know how great along with important the book Porn & Pong: How Grand Theft
Auto, Tomb Raider and other Sexy Games Changed Our Culture. All type of book can you see on many
options. You can look for the internet methods or other social media.

Helen Williams:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book has been rare? Why
so many concern for the book? But just about any people feel that they enjoy with regard to reading. Some
people likes studying, not only science book but in addition novel and Porn & Pong: How Grand Theft Auto,
Tomb Raider and other Sexy Games Changed Our Culture or others sources were given information for you.
After you know how the truly amazing a book, you feel would like to read more and more. Science
publication was created for teacher or even students especially. Those textbooks are helping them to add
their knowledge. In other case, beside science reserve, any other book likes Porn & Pong: How Grand Theft
Auto, Tomb Raider and other Sexy Games Changed Our Culture to make your spare time more colorful.
Many types of book like this one.

Connie Nixon:

A number of people said that they feel fed up when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt the item
when they get a half parts of the book. You can choose the actual book Porn & Pong: How Grand Theft
Auto, Tomb Raider and other Sexy Games Changed Our Culture to make your current reading is interesting.
Your own skill of reading proficiency is developing when you such as reading. Try to choose straightforward
book to make you enjoy to learn it and mingle the idea about book and looking at especially. It is to be initial
opinion for you to like to open up a book and learn it. Beside that the e-book Porn & Pong: How Grand Theft



Auto, Tomb Raider and other Sexy Games Changed Our Culture can to be your new friend when you're feel
alone and confuse using what must you're doing of this time.
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