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As a result of the industrialization, urbanization, and population increase during the last two centuries, the
global landscape has been irreversibly damaged. These anthropological pressures have create endless
problems on the global level, and individuals and organizations are beginning to realize their own ever-
increasing responsibility to consider the welfare and interests of all stakeholders as a whole. Although the
improvements in the legal framework at the national and international level can be viewed as an important
step to protect society and the natural environment, a legal course provides a reactive mode of control rather
than a proactive approach. Considering its proactive approach and voluntarily basis, the concept of social
responsibility can provide a significant tool of generating a sustainable future.

During such a paradigm shift, Contemporary Issues in Corporate Social Responsibility presents the
significant roles that universities must embrace in order to take charge of the future. In parallel to those
movements, many institutions include a course on social responsibility, yet the studies on the education of
social responsibility in the literature show that there is no commonly accepted teaching methods and guiding
curriculum of CSR. This book was designed based on the outcomes of an Erasmus Intensive Project (IP)
which was organized in Yasar University during June 2012 with the contribution of 9 European universities.
Based on the interactive feedback of participants during the project, this book sheds light on the ongoing
discussion of corporate social responsibility from a European perspective.
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From reader reviews:

Shawn Croll:

With other case, little people like to read book Contemporary Issues in Corporate Social Responsibility. You
can choose the best book if you like reading a book. Providing we know about how is important a book
Contemporary Issues in Corporate Social Responsibility. You can add knowledge and of course you can
around the world with a book. Absolutely right, because from book you can understand everything! From
your country until foreign or abroad you can be known. About simple issue until wonderful thing you are
able to know that. In this era, you can open a book or maybe searching by internet gadget. It is called e-book.
You may use it when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's learn.

Rhonda Hoffman:

Now a day those who Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by interact with the internet and the
resources included can be true or not need people to be aware of each facts they get. How a lot more to be
smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Reading a book can
help people out of this uncertainty Information specifically this Contemporary Issues in Corporate Social
Responsibility book since this book offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course the data in this book
hundred percent guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Elizabeth Easterling:

Information is provisions for folks to get better life, information presently can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a knowledge or any news even an issue. What people must be consider
any time those information which is from the former life are challenging be find than now's taking seriously
which one would work to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you receive the unstable
resource then you get it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All of those
possibilities will not happen throughout you if you take Contemporary Issues in Corporate Social
Responsibility as the daily resource information.

Kathy Donnelly:

People live in this new day of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the time or they will get lot of
stress from both way of life and work. So , if we ask do people have time, we will say absolutely sure.
People is human not only a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity do you have when the spare
time coming to you of course your answer can unlimited right. Then do you try this one, reading guides. It
can be your alternative within spending your spare time, the particular book you have read is actually
Contemporary Issues in Corporate Social Responsibility.
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